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Anchor Bay School District
Bid Tabulation

Name: District Security Renovations 
Date: April 17, 2024 at 1:30pm 
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Section 27 21 00
Low Voltage Cabling

Section 27 22 19
Server, SAN and Data Center

Equipment
Section 28 20 00

Video Monitoring Equipment

1 Datacom Group Y Y B Y Y Y Y $132,650.00 NO BID NO BID

2 D/A Central Y Y B Y Y Y Y $38,401.23 $30,637.50 $294,263.16

3 Presidio Y Y B Y Y Y Y NO BID $39,671.51 $546,172.25

4 AOB / Security Designs Y Y Y Y Y Y $115,053.75 $245,852.45 $498,093.30

5 Everon / ADT Commercial Y Y B Y Y Y Y $98,772.50 $34,953.35 $439,223.63

6 AmmComm Y Y B Y Y Y Y $106,400.00 NO BID NO BID

7 Moss Telecommunications Y Y B Y Y Y Y $151,275.62 $88,133.38 $411,705.67

8 Electromedia Y Y B Y Y Y Y $131,490.00 NO BID NO BID

9 Nerds Express N $88,385.00 $201,707.25 $276,707.25

10 Delta Networks Y Y B Y Y Y Y NO BID $89,207.71 $394,498.77

Non-Compliant Bid.

Avigilon Solution

Non-Compliant Bid.

Not willing to do only cabling.

Non-Compliant Bid.


